City of Kent

2016 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

UNIVAR Northstar Cascade JCI JONES Olin Chlor HASA, INC. Wesmar Co., Inc.
USA, INC. Chemical Columbia Dist Chemical, INC Alkali Products
Item #1 $ 650.00 ea.
N NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $3,900.00
Item #2 $ 650.00 ea.
. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $3,250.00
Item #3 $300.00 ea.
) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $3,000.00
Item #4 $300.00 ea.
. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $1,200.00
Item #5 $300.00 ea.
) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $600.00
Item #6 $0.94 |b.
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Naf Total $37,600.00
Item #7 $1.24 gal. $1.56 gal. $1.59
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12.5% NaOCL Total $2,976.00 Total $3,744.00 Total $3,816.00
ltem #8 $1.24 gal. $1.70 gal. $1.59
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12.5% NaOCL Total $1,488.00 Total $2,040.00 Total $1,908.00
Item #9 $4.00 Ib. $1.97.77 Ib. $3.89
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
KMNO4 Total $4,380.00 Total $2,164.82 Total $4,259.55
.8452 gal. .83 gal. .897 gal. 0.70 gal ea.
Item #10 S ga $.83ga S ga $ galea NO BID NO BID NO BID
NaOH 25% Total $81,139.20 Total $79,680.00 Total $86,112.00 Total $67,200.00
Item #11 .8452 gal. .83 gal. .897 gal. 0.70 gal ea.
> &a > 83ga 5897 ga $0.70gal ea NO BID NO BID NO BID
NaOH 25% Total $10,142.40 Total $9,960.00 Total $10,764.00 Total $8,400.00
Item #12 $1.24 gal. $1.30 gal. $1.30 gal ea.
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NaOH 25% Total $1,240.00 Total $1,300.00 Total $1,300.00
Item #13 .8452 gal. .83 gal. .897 gal. 0.70 gal ea.
> ga > 83ga 5897 ga 30.70gal ea NO BID NO BID NO BID
NaOH 25% Total $6,716.60 Total $6,640.00 Total $7,176.00 Total $5,600.00
$4,464.00 Item #7, 8 39,764.82 Item #6, 9 $11,950 Item #1-5
$1,240.00 Item #12 $81,200.00 Item #10, 11, 13
Totals: $5,704.00 $39,764.82 $93,150.00




