City of Kent
2015 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

UNIVAR Northstar Cascade JCI JONES Olin Chlor HASA, INC. BHS Specialty . . Thatcher Co.
WESMAR CO., INC. . Orca Pacific, INC. Chemrite,INC.
USA, INC. Chemical Columbia Dist Chemical, INC Alkali Products Chemical Products Montana,INC.
Item #1 NO BID NO BID Nnopip | _860000ea b0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas I Total $3,600.00 |
Item #2 | $60000ea |
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Chlorine Gas © © © !_ Total $3,000.00 _! © © © © © © ©
Item #3 NO BID NO BID nopip | _820000ea | op NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas | Total $2,000.00 |
Item #4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20000ea |\ opp NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas | Total $800.00 |
Item #5 T $20000ea

. NO BID NO BID noBD | 00 €a. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas L Total $400.00 1
Item #6 = " s085lb. 1 $ .6071b,
Nof NO BID NO BID { Total $34.000.00 J| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Total $7.880.00 NO BID
Item #7 $1.85 gal, $1.76 gal, I~ $150gal. 1 $146qal. $1.95 gal
12.5% NaOCL | Total $4,440.00 | Total $4,224.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 1 Totai 5360000 | Total $3504.00 | Total $4,680.00 NOBID NO BID
Item #8 $ 1.85 gal. $1.76 gal. '~ "$160gal. 1| $146gal. $1.95 gal .
12.5% NaOCL | Total $2,220.00 | Total $2,112.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 1 rotai$1,92000 | Total $1,75200 | Total $2,340.00 NOBID NOBID
Item #9 $2.751b. I~ s1441b | $2.471b.
KMNO4 NOBID NOBID Total $3,011.25 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID | Total $1,576.80 | NO BID Total $2,704.65
Item #10 $.8177 gal. $.92 gal. $.95gal . | $07257galea. |
NaOH 25% Total $78,499.20 | Total $88,320.00 | Total $91,20000 | Total $69,667.20 | NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
tem #11 $ 8177 gal. $ .92 gal. $9gal. | $07257galea |
NaOH 25% Total $9,812.40 | Total $11,040.00 | Total $11.400.00 | Total$8,70840 1  NOBIP NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID
Item #12 i_ _$731_77_gzx _i $ 1.54 gal. $1.30 gal ea. $ 1.40 gal ea.
NaOH25% | Total $817.70 | Total $1,540.00 NO BID Total $1,300.00 NOBID NOBID Total $1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ltem #13 $ 8177 gal. $ .92 gal. $950al. | $0.7257galea |
NaOH 25% Total $6,541.60 | Total $7,360.00 | Total $7,600.00 | Total$580560 | O B'P NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID

$817.00 Item#12 $34,000 Item #6  $9,800 Item #1-5 $3,600.00 Item#7 $1,576.80 Item#9
$84,181.20 Item #10,11,13 $1,920.00 Item#8

Totals: $817.00 $34,000.00 $93,981.20 $5.520.00 $1,576.80
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