City of Kent
2014 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Results

UNIVAR | NORTHSTAR | CASCADE JCIJONES Olin Chlor HASA,INC. |WESMAR COQ.,| Airgas USA, | Sterling Water |Sierra Chemical General
USA, INC. CHEMICAL |COLUMBIA DIST.| CHEMICAL, INC. | Alkali Products INC. LLC Technologies Co. Chemical
Item #1 NO BID NO BID NoBD p S800%0ca. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas i Total $3,600.00 ,
Ttem #2 I S60000ea
. NO BID NO BID NO BID | e | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas LTIota,I;SS,O(‘}j0,0Q, 1
Item #3 NO BID NO BID NO BID ;— _s-z'é'(;b-ﬁ;_-} NO BID NO BID NO BID $190.00 ea. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas I Total $2,000.00 | Total $1,900.00
Item #4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 520000 e2‘jl NO BID NO BID NO BID $190.00 ea. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas . Total $800.00 4 Totat $760.00
Item #5 I 5200000 | $190.00 ea.
Chiorine Gas NO BID NO BID NO BID | Totaisioo00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID Total $380.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #6 I soTim
Nof NO BID NO BID | Total $28,400.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #7 $1.535 gal. $ 1.54 gal.
12.5% NaOCL | Total $3,684.00 | Total §3,696.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #8 $1.535 gal. $1.54 gal.
12.5% NaOCL | Total $1.822.00 | Tota1 $1.848 00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ttem #9 [ s2sb | $3.25b.
KMNO4 NO BID NO BID | Total 250000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Total $3.250.00 NO BID
Item #10 $0.868 gal. $0.81 gal. T S070ear | $0.97 gal.
NaOH 25%  |Total $83,328.00 Total $77,776.00 NOBID E‘Q'Tbtal‘ $67,20000J| NOBID NOBID NOBID Total $93,120.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID
Item #11 $0.868 gal. $0.81 gal. B 75‘0.7:0- sal. | $0.97 gal.
NaOH 25% | Total $10,416.00| Total $9,720.00 NOBID ! Totar 5840000 | NOBID NOBID NOBID Total $11,640.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID
Ttem #12 I SLo3gal | $1.30 gal.
BID - ak
NaOH 25% NO | Total $1,030.00 | NO BID Total $1,390.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #13 $0.868 gal. $0.81 gal 1 5070gal | $0.97 gal.
NaOH 25% | Total $6,944.00 | Total $6,480.00 NOBD :f - Total $5,600.00 : NOBD NOEBD NOBID Total $7,760.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID
$1,030 Item #12  $28,400 Item #6  $9,800 Item #1-5 $5,400 Item #7-8
$2,500 Ttem #9 31,200 Item #10, 11, 13
Totals: $1,030 $30,900 $91,000 $5,400
P:\Operatio trtmnt\2014chemicalbids.xls




