
UNIVAR NORTHSTAR CASCADE JCI JONES Olin Chlor HASA, INC.

USA, INC. CHEMICAL COLUMBIA DIST. CHEMICAL, INC. Alkali Products

Item #1

Chlorine Gas

Item #2

Chlorine Gas

Item #3

Chlorine Gas

Item #4

Chlorine Gas

Item #5

Chlorine Gas

Item #6

Naf

Item #7

12.5% NaOCL

Item #8

12.5% NaOCL

Item #9

KMNO4

Item #10

NaOH 25%

Item #11

NaOH 25%

Item #12

NaOH 25%

Item #13

NaOH 25%

*  Product submitted not accepted

P:\Operations\water\trtmnt\2013chemicalbids.xls

$ 0.83 gal.           

Total $6,640.00
NO BID

$ 0.83 gal.           

Total $9,960.00
NO BID

NO BID
$ 1.05 gal.           

Total $1,050.00
NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$ 0.83 gal.             

Total $79,680.00

$ 0.96 gal.     

Total $92,160.00

$ 1.20 gal.            

Total $115,200.00

$ 0.96 gal.       

Total $11,520.00

$ 1.20 gal.          

Total $14,400.00

NO BID

$ 1.58 gal.       

Total $1,580.00
NO BID

$ 0.96 gal.       

Total $7,680.00

$ 3.52 lb.         

Total $3,520.00
NO BID

$ 2.45 lb.             

Total $2,450.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 1.20 gal.             

Total $9,600.00
NO BID

$1.64 gal.             

Total $3,936.00
NO BID

$1.64 gal.             

Total $1,968.00
NO BID NO BID

NO BID

$ 200.00 ea.         

Total $400.00
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$ 0.694 lb.*        

Total $27,760.00
NO BID

$ 0.72 lb.              

Total $28,800.00

$ 200.00 ea.           

Total $800.00
NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$ 600.00 ea.          

Total $3,600.00
NO BID

$ 600.00 ea.         

Total $3,000.00
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$ 200.00 ea.          

Total $2,000.00
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$1.57 gal.             

Total $3,768.00

$1.57 gal.             

Total $1,884.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$ 0.97 gal.            

Total $93,120.00

$ 0.97 gal.            

Total $11,640.00

NO BID

WESMAR 

CO., INC.

K.A. Steel 

Chemicals, Inc.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$ 0.97 gal.            

Total $7,760.00

Sterling Water 

Technologies 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

City of Kent
2013 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Results

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


