2012 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Results

City of Kent

UNIVAR | NORTHSTAR CASCADE JCI JONES Olin Chlor HASA, INC. [WESMAR CO.,
USA, INC. CHEMICAL _|COLUMBIA DIST.| CHEMICAL, INC. | Alkali Products INC.

Item #1 S E(-)(;_;)(Tea |

' O BID
Chlorine Gas NO BID NO BID NO BID | e ss6on00 | NO BID NO BID N
Ttem #2 |"'§ a(ﬁf)-e: = 1

. NO BID B | w BID
Chlorine Gas . o NOBID NOBID | Total $3,00Q 00 | NO BID NO BID NO
Ttem #3 '—--’-00_7""‘

. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas
Item #4

. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas
Item #5

. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas
Item #6 $0.679 Ib.
Naf Total $27.160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ttem #7 I " gissgal $1.67 gal. $1.65 gal.
12.5% NaocL| NOBID LTotal s379200 | NOBD Total $4,008.00 NO BID NOBID Total $3,960.00
Item #8 | $158gal $1.67 gal. $1.65 gal.
125%NaocL|  NOPP | retsigoseo | NOPP Towl $2,00400 | NOPIP NOBID | ool $1,980.00
Item #9 $3.385 Ib.
KMNOA Totel $3385.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[tem #10 $0.902 gal. $1.5375 gal.
NaOH 25% | Total $86,592.00 Total $147,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ttem #11 $0.902 gal. $1.5375 gal.
NaOH 25% | Total $7,216.00 | Total $12,300.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID
Item #12 $ 1.159 gal. $ 1.9875 gal.
NaOH 25% | Total $1,159.00 | Total $1,987.50 NOBID NO BID NOBID
Ttem #13 $0902gal. | $1.5375 gal [~ Tqossga

: . 0 BID

NaOH 25% | Total $14,432.00| Total $24,600.00 NOBID | Total s13,280.00 | NOBID NOBID N
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