City of Kent

2008 Chemical Bid Results .
UNIVAR Ashland CASCADE Thatcher JCI JONES Olin Chlor {EQUA-CHLOR

USA, INC. Distribution COLUMBIA DIST. Company CHEMICAL, INC. | Alkali Products
ftem #1 NO BID NO BID . NOBID NO BID $ 850.00 ca. NO BID
Chlorine Gas
Item #2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 850.00 ca. NO BID
Chlorine Gas _
Item #3 NO BID NO BID " NOBID NO BID $200.00 ca. NO BID
Chlorine Gas
Item #4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $200.00 ea. NO BID
Chlorine Gas
ftem #5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 200.00 ea. NO BID
Chiorine Gas -
ii? #6 $0.81 b, NO BID $0.9487 1b NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hem #7
NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 gal. NO BID NO BID
12.5% NaOCL &
Item #8
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12.5% NaQCL
{tem #9
$ 3.44 Ib. $3.78 per Ib NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
KMNO4 P
Item #10
$ 1.741 gal. $1.98 i NO BID NO BID $ 1.28 gal. NO BID
NaOH 25% & pet ga : &
Item #11
$1.741 gal. $1.98 1 NO BID NO BID $1.28 gal. NO BID
NaOH 25% & per ga &
Item #12
$ 1.741 gal. $1.98 i NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.80 gal
NaOH 25% & pet £a &
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