2025 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

City of Kent

JCI JONES UNIVAR Cascade Northstar Westmar
Item Location & Amount Chemical, INC Solutions Columbia Dist Chemical Company
PO PO PO
i $2,900 each
1 el Sp”r.]gs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(6) 1 Ton Chlorine Gas Total $17,400
i $2,900 each
2 NCIE Sprlngs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(5) 1 Tons Chlorine Gas Total $14,500
i $611 each $669 each
3 East Hill well NO BID eac NO BID NO BID
(10) 150 Ibs. Chlorine Gas Total $6,110 Total $6,690
$611 each 669 each
4 Armstrong NO BID $669 eac NO BID NO BID
(4) 150 Ibs. Chlorine Gas Total $2,444 Total $2,676
$611 each 669 each
5 7 Oaks NO BID $669 eac NO BID NO BID
(2) 150 Ibs. Chlorine Gas Total $1,222 Total $1,338
i 1.48 d
6 e Sp_”ngs _ NO BID NO BID $ ORI NO BID NO BID
30,000 Ibs. Sodium Fluoride Total $44,400
7 212th Treatment Plant NO BID $3.35 gallon NO BID $3.17 gallon $3.75 gallon
10,000 gallons Sodium Hypochlorite Total $33,500 Total $31,700 Total $37,500
8 Garrison NG BID $3.35 gallon NO BID $3.89 gallon 3.75 gallon
1,200 gallons Sodium Hypochlorite Total $4,020 Total $4,668 Total $4,500
5.32 d 1.60 d
O* 21_2th NO BID $ poun ¢ B NO BID NO BID
2,000 Ibs. Potassium Permanganate Total $11,725.28 * Total $3,526.40 *
10 PS#5 $1.08 gallon $1.0913 gallon $1.53 gallon $1.18 gallon NO BID
96,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $103,680 Total $104,764.80 Total $146,880 Total $113,280
11 EHW $1.08 gallon $1.0913 gallon $1.53 gallon $1.18 gallon NO BID
12,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $12,960 Total $13,095.60 Total $18,360 Total $14,160
12 212th Treatment Plant NO BID $1.91 gallon NG BID $2.42 gallon $2.85 gallon
1,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $1,910 Total $2,420 Total $2,850
13 Guib. Corrosion $1.08 gallon $1.0913 gallon $1.55 gallon $1.18 gallon NO BID
8,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $8,640 Total $8,730.40 Total $12,400 Total $9,440
Totals Items 1-5 & 10,11,13 Items 8,12 tems 6 & 9 Item 7
$166,956 $5,930.00 $47,926.40 $31,700

* Includes 10.2% WA sales tax




