City of Kent
2023 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

JCI JONES UNIVAR Cascade Northstar
Item Location & Amount Chemical, INC Solutions Columbia Dist Chemical
Clark Springs $ 2,750 each
1 6 Tons CI2 Gas Total $16,500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Kent Springs $ 2,750 each
2 5Tons CI2 Gas Total $13,750 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EHW $ 600 each
3 (10) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $6,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Armstrong $ 600 each
4 (4) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $2,400 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 Oaks $ 600 each
S (2) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $1,200 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clark Springs $ 1.50 pound
6 30,000 pounds Fluoride NO BID NG BID Total $45,000 NO BID
212th $ 3.05 gallon $3.04 gallon
NO BID NO BID
7 10,000 gallons Hypo © Total $30,500 © Total $30,400
Garrison $ 3.05 gallon $3.27 gallon
8 1,200 gallons Hypo NO BID Total $3,660 NOBID Total $3,924
Potassium Permanganate $ 7.53 pound $ 4.90 pound
* NO BID NO BID
9 2,000 Ibs. Total $16,566* Total $10,780*
10 PS#5 $ 1.83 gallon $ 3.4612 gallon $2.79 gallon $1.58 gallon
96,000 gallons Caustic Total $175,680 Total $332,275.20 Total $267,840 Total $151,680
11 EHW $ 1.83 gallon $ 3.4612 gallon $2.79 gallon $1.58 gallon
12,000 gallons Caustic Total $21,960 Total $41,534.40 Total $33,480 Total $18,960
212th $ 3.85 gallon $3.84 gallon
12 1000 gallons Caustic NO BID Total $3,850 NO BID Total $3,840
13 Guib. Corrosion $ 1.83 gallon $ 3.4612 gallon $2.79 gallon $1.58 gallon
8,000 gallons Caustic Total $14,640 Total $27,689.60 Total $22,320 Total $12,640
* Includes 10.1% Totals ltems 1-5 ltem 8 ltems 6 & 9 ltems 7, 10-13
WA sales tax $39,850 $3,660 $55,780 $217,520




