City of Kent
2022 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

Location & JCI JONES UNIVAR Cascade Northstar TRI
It
em Order Amount Chemical, INC Solutions Columbia Dist Chemical Trading Company
1 Clark Springs $1,500.00 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 Tons CI2 Gas Total $9,000.00
K i 1 . h
2 ent Springs DESLUIE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Tons CI2 Gas Total $7,500.00
EHW $500.00 each
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 (10) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $5,000.00
Armstrong $500.00 each
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 (4) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $2,000.00
5 7 Oaks DU NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(2) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $1,000.00
Clark Springs $1.40 pound
6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30,000 pounds Fluoride Total $42,000.00
7 212th NO BID $2.32 gallon NO BID $2.56 gallon NO BID
1,600 gallons Hypo Total $3,712.00 Total $4,096.00
8 Garrison NO BID $2.32 gallon NO BID $2.56 gallon NO BID
1,200 gallons Hypo Total $2,784.00 Total $3,072.00
9 Potassium Permanganate NO BID $ 5.58 pound $2.75 pound NO BID NO BID
1,000 Ibs. Total $6,138.00* Total $3,025.00*
10 PS#5 $ 1.08 gallon $1.099 gallon $1.87 gallon $1.295 gallon $ 1.55 gallon
96,000 gallons Caustic Total $103,680.00 Total $105,504.00 Total $179,520.00 Total $124,320.00 Total $148,800.00
11 EHW $1.08 gallon $1.099 gallon $1.87 gallon $1.295 gallon $ 1.55 gallon
12,000 gallons Caustic Total $12,960.00 Total $13,188.00 Total $22,440.00 Total $15,540.00 Total $18,600.00
12 212th NO BID $2.29 gallon NO BID $3.13 gallon NO BID
1000 gallons Caustic Total $2,290.00 Total $3,130.00
13 Guib. Corrosion $ 1.08 gallon $1.099 gallon $1.87 gallon $1.295 gallon $ 1.55 gallon
8,000 gallons Caustic Total $8,640.00 Total $8,792.00 Total $14,960.00 Total $10,360.00 Total $12,400.00
Totals Items 1-5,10,11& 13 Items 7,8 & 12 Items 6 & 9 * Includes 10% WA sales tax
$149,780.00 $8,786.00 $45,025




