2021 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

City of Kent

ocation ascade orthstar
It Location & JCI JONES UNIVAR C d Northst TRI
em Order Amount Chemical, INC Solutions Columbia Dist Chemical Trading Company
1 Clark Springs $ 700.00 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 Tons ClI2 Gas Total $4,200.00
i 700.00 each
2 Kent Springs $ eac NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Tons CI2 Gas Total $3,500.00
EHW $ 400.00 each
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 (10) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $4,000.00
Armstrong $ 400.00 each
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 (4) 150 pounds ClI2 Gas Total $1,600.00
400. h
5 7 Oaks $400.00 eac NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(2) 150 pounds CI2 Gas Total $800.00
6 Clark Springs NO BID NO BID $1.13 pound NO BID NO BID
30,000 pounds Fluoride Total $33,900.00
7 212th NO BID $ 1.99 gallon $2.71 gallon $2.33 gallon NO BID
1,600 gallons Hypo Total $3,184.00 Total $4,336.00 Total $3,728.00
8 Garrison NO BID $1.99 gallon $3.26 gallon $2.33 gallon NO BID
1,200 gallons Hypo Total $2,388.00 Total $3,912.00 Total $2,796.00
9 Potassium Permanganate NO BID $5.17 pound $2.05 pound NO BID NO BID
1,000 lbs. Total $5,687.00 Total $2,255.00
10 PS#5 $.70 gallon $0.7227 gallon $1.75 gallon $1.18 gallon $0.985 gallon
96,000 gallons Caustic Total $67,200.00 Total $69,379.20 Total $168,000.00 Total $113,280.00 Total $94,560.00
11 EHW $.70 gallon $0.7227 gallon $1.75 gallon $1.18 gallon $0.985 gallon
12,000 gallons Caustic Total $8,400.00 Total $8,672.40 Total $21,000.00 Total $14,160.00 Total $11,820.00
12 212th NO BID $ 1.89 gallon $2.30 gallon $2.45 gallon NO BID
1000 gallons Caustic Total $1,890.00 Total $2,300.00 Total $2,450.00
13 Guib. Corrosion $.70 gallon $0.7227 gallon $1.75 gallon $1.18 gallon $0.985 gallon
8,000 gallons Caustic Total $5,600.00 Total $5,781.60 Total $14,000.00 Total $9,440.00 Total $7,880.00
Totals Items 1-5,10,11& 13 Items 7,8 & 12 Items 6 & 9
$95,300.00 $7,462.00 $36,155




